RFQ 24/11 Musical Instruments
Award: Strings Instruments to Booth, Band Instruments to Music & Arts

“Alamo Music Center

San A

Delgado Guitars LLC
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ayne,

Sweetwater Sound LLC

Shar Products Company

Arbor, MI

K&S Music

Berkeley

y Heights,

Booth Music|

Spani

h Fork, UT

Palen Music Center

Colu

‘Washington Music Sales Center, INC
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Cello 4/4

Full Size

979.97

s

5879.82

Sheryl & |SRSSE4
Roth

S 120000

s

7,200.00

ca10

595.00

60-120

core
academy

A3

s

3.870.00

Franz
Hoffman

Amadeus
PCT100
Ta4

3.582.00

90 days

Meisel

727.00

s

4362.00

Krutz

ca10

695.00

4,170.00

Maple
Leaf

MLS130
c

No Bid

Cello 3/4

939.97

s

1221961

Sheryl & |SRSSE3
Roth  [H

S 120000

s

15,600.00

310

595.00

60-120

re
academy

A312

s

8.385.00

30 days

Franz
Hoffman

Amadeus
PCT100
T34

7.761.00

90 days

core
academy

727.00

s

9.451.00

Krutz

310

695.00

9,035.00

Maple
Leaf

MLS130
c

No Bid

Viola 15"

379.97

s

1,139.91

Sheryl & |SRS2E1
Roth  [sH

S 65000

s

1,950.00

AS10

60-120

re
academy

A21-15

S 185.00

s

555.00

Franz
Hoffiman

Amadeus
00T

750.00

30 days

core
academy

7190VA

295.00

s

885.00

Krutz

AS10

388.00

1,164.00

Maple
Leaf

MLS130
VA

No Bid

286.00

Violin 4/4

Full Size
Violin
wiCase
and Bow

29497

s

530946

Sheryl &[SRs1E4
Roh  [H

S 42900

s

7722

Ad10

199.00

60-120

re
academy

A-11-1

S 185.00

s

3.330.00

30 days

Franz
Hoffman

Amadeus

HY
m

3,780.00

30 days

core
academy

61054

253.00

s

4,554.00

Krutz

V10

328.00

5,904.00

Maple
Leaf

MLS130
VN

No Bid

249.50

Violin 3/4

Full Size
Violin

29497

s

7,669.22 3

Sheryl & |SRSIE3
Roth  [H

s 42900

s

11,1500 2

V310

199.00

s

6-120

core
academy

A-112

5 175.00

s

4,550.00

30 days

Franz
Hoffman

Amadeus
HV100T
34

s

5.460.00

30 days

core
academy

6105A

s

6.578.00

Krutz

V310

328.00

s

8.528.00

Maple
Leaf

MLS130
VN

No Bid

249.50

Alto Sax

wiCase.

111197

s

5.559.85

yamaha

No Bid

1,199.00

s

June

yamaha

No Bid

3,995.00

30 days

RS
Berkeley

ALS003

808.00

s

4,040.00

In stock

upiter

JASTI0G
NA

1,167.00

S 96645

700.00

French

Yamaha

254097

s

762291

yamaha

No Bid

S 274500

N

August

yamaha

No Bid

$ 243600

s

7,308.00

90 days

Jupiter

JHR100

s

2,668.00

8,004.00

S 253980

s

ASS

3,105.00

Percussion

Musser
LMXYL
o

Xylopho

Practice
Pad - and

s

5786.73

Musser

No Bid

660.00

5940

in stock

Musser

No Bid

No Bid

s

647.00

B

5,823.00

Musser

LMXYL
o

S 62000

s

A/S

No Bid

Clarinet

Yamaha
YCL255
Standard
Bb

Clarinet
wiCase

45697

s

10,053.34

yamaha

No Bid

493.00

s

Oct

yamaha

No Bid

s

10.978.00

30 days

RS
Berkeley

BEAU40

8

337.00

$ 741400

90 days

upiter

1CL7000

480.00

s

10,560.00

397.10

s

ASS

310,00

Trombone

Yamaha
Y5200
AD
Advantag
e

Trombon
e wiCase

61697

s

987152

yamaha

No Bid

665.00

s

Nov

yamaha

YSL-354

No Bid

s

9,584.00

30 days

RS
Berkeley

TB703

563.00

$9,008.00

90 days

upiter

1CTBT00
A

s

647.00

10352.00

535.90

s

ASS

375.00

Trumpet

Yamaha
YTR200
ADII
Advantag
e
Standard

61697

12,956.37

yamaha

No Bid

663.00

N

Jan

yamaha

2330

No Bid

s

8.505.00

30 days

RS
Berkeley

TP6540

445.00

$ 9,345.00

90 days

upiter

ITR700A

s

647.00

s

13,587.00

535.90

N

ASS

324.00

Flute

43497

s

8.264.43

yamaha

No Bid

47000

N

Nov

yamaha

YFL-222

No Bid

s

5.605.00

30 days

RS
Berkeley

F102

337.00

$ 6403.00

90 days

upiter

JFL700A

s

457.00

s

8.683.00

377.90

H

ASS

265.00




BAC Music Center ‘National Education Music Co. LTd "Alto Music Field Violins Music & arts Morrison Music, LLC
KC, Piscat Piscat Jefferson City, M Freq Columbia, MO
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S 313200 [6-12mo :3" s § 385530 ::"““h" $ 54000 |'$ 324000 MLSHO § 548400 [30days [Kruz 100 § 51469 |'s 308814 Strobel - [MC-80 s 813.00 487800 [23-Oct  [Eastman No Bid
VCso Peretschn| MLS110
S 678600 |6-12mo <SBC s §  83531s - § 54000 |'S  7.02000 e $ 1188200 [30days [Kruz 100 s 51469 |'$ 669097 Strobel - [MC-80 $ 81300 |'$ 1056900 |23-Oct  |Eastman No Bid
" VASO Peretschn| MLS120
s 85800 |6-12mo SBC s 1107.00 - $ 26000 S 78000 VALS $ 138900 [30days [Kruz 100 s 30275 |s 90825 Strobel - [MA-80 $  479.00 1437.00 [23-Sep  [Eastman No Bid
VL8O Peretschn| MLS110 o
S 449100 |6-12 mo SBC § 482400 - S 16000 |'S 288000 Vit $ 757800 [30days [Kruz 100 s 25729 s 463122 Strobel [ ML-80 $ 41500 7.470.00 [23-Oct  [Eastman No Bid
VL8O 23 Peretschn| MLS110 o y S
S 6487.00 sBC $ $  6968.00 o $ 16000 |S 416000 Vah $ 1094600 [30days [Krutz |10 § 25729 'S 668954 Strobel [ ML-80 $ 41500 | 1079000 |23-0ct | Eastman No Bid
BAC-AS-| S S S S 5
S 3.50000 |4 mo 10 s § 593030 $ 115600 |'$ 578000 5 99048 | 5 495240 $ 1,095.00 5475.00 |23-Sep | Eastman 1044
BAC-FH-|
S 931500 |[4mo Ly s 813207 § 264200 |'$ 7.926.00 $ 271640 |'$ 814920 $ 196000 5.880.00 [23-Jul  [Eastman 2660
s s9m6| S 64200 |8 577800 67571 |'$ 6,081.39 No Bid No Bid
BAC-CL-| .
S 682000 |1mo 10 s $ 1072170 § 47500 |'S 1045000 s 27216 | 598752 $ 63000 |'$ 1386000 |23-Jul  |Eastman 429
BAC-SL- S - N 5
S 600000 |4mo 10 s $ 1052272 Yamaha $ 64100 |'$ 1025600 § 49695 |'s 795120 Yamaha |YSL-354 S 603.00 9,648.00 [23-Nov  [Eastman 566
S 680400 |4 mo IB{(‘)"TR' s S 1381107 Yamaha S 64100 |'$ 1346100 :'IT]'; s 47488 |'s 997248 Yamaha f;z $ 60300 | 1266300 |23-Sep |Eastman 529
BAC-FL- '
S 503500 |1 mo P s § 881125 Yamaha § 45200 |'S 858800 YFL-222 s 34765 |'$ 660535 Yamaha |YFL-222 No Bid 366




