
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

Description Qty

Custodial   

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
 Bid Tab

RFQ 24/26

Custodial Equipment

8/31/2023

1 Yale 
ESC040AD

$54,230.00

See Below in Green

Medley Equipment Company, 
Columbia, MO

All Type Vacuum & Janitorial 
Supply, St Louis, MO

All Type Vacuum & Janitorial 
Supply, St Louis, MO 
ALTERNATE ITEM 3

Global Equipment Company 
Inc., Port Washington, NY

Imperial Dade - St Louis 
Facility, Hazelwood, MO

Veritiv Operating Company, 
Atlanta, GA

No Bid

Hyster

Item 2: Walk Behind Floor Scrubber 6
Minuteman 
Powerboss 

Phoenix 20TD
$8,200.00

No Bid
Big Joe LXE 

Spark
$35,456.69No BidItem 1: Stand Up Forklift

$8,635.70

Minuteman E20 Cylindrical

Advance 
Adfinity X20C

$9,229.00
Minuteman 

E20 Cylindrical 
MINE20CQPG

$6,171.00
Cat Auto Floor 
Scrubber C20T

3 No Bid 

$4,630.45
Tomcat 155V2-

25TC

Tennant B5-
510

$10,899.00

NSS Charger 2022 DB

Item 4: Stripping Machine 1 No Bid 

NSS Charger 
2022 

64020228
$11,788.00

Tennant/Nobles 
Speed Gleam 5 

SG5-510
$11,395.81

Clarke Ultra 
Speed 

56383523
$7,772.47

NSS Charger 
2022DB

$7,836.70Item 3: Walk Behind Battery Burnisher

$1,682.39
TomCat Edge 

NTC-300-20TE-
16B

$2,836.00

TomCat Edge

2395000 $180.00TomCat Edge $2,654.00
TomCat Edge 

NTC-300-20TE-
16B

$2,950.51
Koblenz SP-

15N

Planet Holdings Inc, Pembroke 
Pines, FL

EK20RL $31,071.00

20 T55/50 B $5,960.00

Z090056 $2,029.00


