
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

Item 10 

- Pallet 

Jack

Item 11 

- Stand 

Up Fork 

Lift

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost Total for 6

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost Total for 3

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost Total for 2

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost Total for 3

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost

Total for 

2

Brand/

Model
Unit Cost

Unit 

Cost

Unit 

Cost

Items - Not awarded

$3,990.38

$0.00

Total By 

Vendor

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

24/23

Nutrition Services Equipment

7/24/2023

Nutrition Services

Ford Hotel Supply & Douglas Equipment

Vendor

Item 1-Commercial 

Convection Oven Notes

Beverag

e Air 

Blodgett 

DFG-100 

Beverag

e Air 
NO BID$6,324.52

TRUE T-

49F-HC
$6,481.96 $3,316.60 NO BID

Bluefield, WV
$6,980.97 $8,315.25 $16,630.50

TRUE T-

72F-HC
$18,973.56Douglas Equipment $14,048.86 $3,834.40 $2,611.16 $2,326.99 $78,001.15

Ford Hotel Supply Co., Inc. $5,430.64 $4,000.00 $3,579.88 $3,194.33 $9,582.99

$3,504.79$7,647.44

$5,293.58$2,646.79
Beverag

e Air 
TRUE 

TMC-58-

TRUE T-

49F-HC
additional cost to 

uncrate,set in Pueblo, CO
$12,951.53 $8,707.14 $17,414.28 $6,622.59 $19,867.77

TRUE T-

72F-HC

$6,553.33 $3,567.66 NO BID
Columbia, MO
Pueblo Hotel Supply $11,175.50 $5,752.74 $5,378.42 $4,030.51

$8,406.82 $16,813.64 $6,394.17 $19,182.51
TRUE T-

72F-HC
$1,995.19

$3,954.14
TRUE 

TMC-58-

TRUE T-

49-HC

NO BID

NO BID

Vulcan 

VC5GD
Vulcan 

VC55GD

$3,990.38

$7,009.58

$23,006.40

$24,000.00

$34,516.44 NO BID

Item 2-Milk Cooler (16 crate) 

TRUE 

TMC-49-
TRUE 

TMC-49-

TRUE 

TMC-34-
TRUE 

TMC-34-

Item 3-Milk 

Cooler (12 crate) 
Item 4-Milk Cooler (8 crate) Item 5-Three Door Freezer Item 6 -Double Door Freezer 

Item 7- Three 

Door Refrigerator

Item 8 -Food 

Warmer/Proofing Cabinet

Item 9 - Garden 

Bar

TRUE T-

72-HC

Metro 

C519-

Cambro 

VBRL615

TRUE T-

72-HC

Metro 

C519-

Cambro 

VBRL615

TRUE T-

72-HC

Metro 

C519-

Cambro 

VBRL615


