
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

ITEM MODEL# QTY Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

YAMAHA 3 VALVE ¾ BBb TUBA WITH 
CASE

YBB-105WC 2 $3,367.00 $6,734.00 $3,645.88 $7,291.76 $3,044.00 $6,088.00 $3,019.97 $6,039.94 $3,268.00 $6,536.00 No Bid No Bid $3,550.00 $7,100.00

YAMAHA LACQUERED TENOR SAX 
W/CASE

YTS-62III 2 $2,917.00 $5,834.00 $3,000.75 $6,001.50 $2,644.00 $5,288.00 $2,619.97 $5,239.94 $2,832.00 $5,664.00 No Bid No Bid $2,840.00 $5,680.00

BACH Bb TRUMPET TR200 SERIES SILVER 
W/CASE

TR200S 1 $1,315.00 $1,315.00 $1,868.03 $1,868.03 $1,599.00 $1,599.00 $1,579.97 $1,579.97 $1,674.00 $1,674.00 $2,121.33 $2,121.33 No Bid $1,750.00 $1,750.00

BACH Bb TRUMPET TR200 SERIES 
LACQUER W/CASE

44277 6 $1,589.00 $9,534.00 $1,790.83 $10,744.98 $1,515.00 $9,090.00 $1,519.97 $9,119.82 $1,604.00 $9,624.00 $2,063.67 $12,382.02 No Bid $1,680.00 $10,080.00

ADAMS 3.3 OCTAVE ARTIST SERIES 
GLOCKENSPIEL*

GAT33 1 $5,100.00 $5,100.00 $5,619.04 $5,619.04 $4,666.00 $4,666.00 $5,379.97 $5,379.97 $5,037.00 $5,037.00 No Bid $5,440.00 $5,440.00 No Bid

Besson Prodige Series 4-Valve Euphonium 
Silver

BE165 3 $2,526.00 $7,578.00 $2,845.48 $8,536.44 $2,411.00 $7,233.00 $2,259.97 $6,779.91 $2,575.00 $7,725.00 No Bid No Bid $2,725.00 $8,175.00

Korg C1 Air Digital Piano with RH3 Action, 
Bluetooth Audio Receiver Black 88 Key

C1AIRBK 1 $1,056.00 $1,056.00 $856.42 $856.42 No Bid $1,169.97 $1,169.97 $1,450.00 $1,450.00 No Bid No Bid $1,070.00 $1,070.00

Gong (Tam-Tam) Paiste 38 inch Symphonic 
Gong

PST-15038 1 $2,041.00 $2,041.00 $2,255.04 $2,255.04 $2,088.00 $2,088.00 $2,379.97 $2,379.97 $2,479.00 $2,479.00 No Bid $2,096.00 $2,096.00 No Bid

Pageantry Innovations Universal Mallet 
Instrument Cart - Large

IC-LG 3 $1,536.00 $4,608.00 $1,566.00 $4,698.00 No Bid $2,229.97 $6,689.91 No Bid No Bid $2,070.00 $6,210.00 $1,690.00 $5,070.00

GRETSCH Drumset catalina maple 5-piece 
shell package with 20” bass drum satin deep 
cherry burst

CM1-E605-
SDCB

1 $850.00 $850.00 $792.28 $792.28 No Bid $779.97 $779.97 $995.00 $995.00 No Bid $831.00 $831.00 No Bid

Award total $1,315.00 $5,554.42 $9,090.00 $18,839.76 $5,037.00

Fine Arts

*Adams model was originally awarded; however, manufacturer discontinued the model; therefore, the PO was canceled. 
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Palen Music Center Music & Arts Taylor Music Alamo Music Center Sweetwater Sound, LLC Delgado Guitars, LLC Steve Weiss Music Woodwind & Brasswind
Columbia, MO Frederick, MD Aberdeen, SD San Antonio, TX Fort Wayne, IN Nashville, TN Willow Grove, PA Westlake Village, CA


