COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab

BID NO: RFQ 23/43
SUBJECT: Nutrition Services Equipment
DATE: 11/15/2022
SCHOOL/DEPT: Nutrition Services
AWARDED TO: See below in green

vendor Ttem 1-D?ul1r_l;= :)tack Oven rtem 2.3 mm Ttem 3-Ice M;chme option( " ;:em 4-Milk Cooker (QTY 4) Item 5- 3 Door Item 6 - Single Door Refrigerator Ttem 7 - Double. | ora Award

UnitCost | Total for 2 Comp. Sink | 5. rkade Paxton Unit Cost [Totalfor2|  Unit Cost Total for 4 AT Unit Cost Total for 2 DOCHRSHigSrater

E:r:';:ﬁr';fgt:“’a"‘ Equipment $9,780.00 $19,560.00 $7,746.00 $5,004.00 $5,498.00 $6,517.00 $13,034.00 $3,492.00 $13,968.00 $7,678.00 $5,346.00 $10,692.00 $6,616.00 $29,392.00
[B’I‘Jgge';f m“ip"‘e"t $11,775.00 $23,550.00 $7,902.01 $6,562.17 $6,376.54 $0.00 $4,564.11 $18,256.44 $9,807.78 $4,979.22 $9,958.44 No price
E;Tm’;i‘:ep!lg"”"’ Co., Inc. $9,517.87 $19,035.74 $9,344.27 $4,679.32 $3,825.93 $4,446.00 | $8,892.00 $4,847.86 $19,391.44 $9,237.24 $4,010.03 $8,020.06 $5,333.28 $27,540.99
i’a‘::a’; 'éﬁ;mga"‘ Supply $10,360.00 $20,720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,760.00 $15,040.00 $8,550.00 $3,715.00 $7,430.00 $4,930.00 $12,360.00




