
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

ITEM MODEL# QTY Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

Unit Cost Total
Est. Delivery 
Time ARO

YAMAHA:

YAMAHA BASS CLARINET W/CASE YCL-221 2 $2,030.00 $4,060.00 Summer 2023 $2,168.10 $4,336.20 1 week $1,894.75 $3,789.50 180 days $2,608.00 $5,216.00 $1,890.97 $3,781.94 No ETA $1,877.00 $3,754.00 May-23 $1,935.00 $3,870.00 60-120 days $2,168.00 $4,336.00 2-45 days

YAMAHA INTERMEDIATE FLUTE 
(OFFSET G; B FOOT, GOLD LIP PLATE) 
W/CASE

YFL-362 8 $1,038.00 $8,304.00 Oct-22 $1,108.80 $8,870.40 Early Sept $969.00 $7,752.00 30-60 days $1,794.00 $14,352.00 $966.97 $7,735.76 $963.00 $7,704.00 45 days $982.00 $7,856.00 30-120 days $1,043.00 $8,344.00 2-45 days

YAMAHA NEO SERIES 
COMPENSATING SILVER EUPHONIUM 
W/CASE

YEP-642II 2 $6,573.00 $13,146.00 Spring 2023 $6,047.80 $12,095.60 Mid Sept $5,502.55 $11,005.10 30-120 days $6,614.00 $13,228.00 $5,275.97 $10,551.94 $6,381.00 $12,762.00 May-23 $5,575.00 $11,150.00 30-90 days $5,241.50 $10,483.00 2-45 days

YAMAHA MARCHING F MELLOPHONE 
LACQUER W/CASE

YMP-204M 8 $1,422.00 $11,376.00 Nov-22 $1,519.10 $12,152.80 1 Week $1,327.60 $10,620.80 60-90 days $1,922.20 $15,377.60 $1,324.97 $10,599.76 $1,506.00 $12,048.00 45 days $1,354.00 $10,832.00 30-90 days $1,519.00 $12,152.00 2-45 days

YAMAHA BASS CLARINET WITH LOW 
EB W/CASE

YCL-221 3 $2,030.00 $6,090.00 Summer 2023 $2,168.10 $6,504.30 1 Week $1,894.75 $5,684.25 180 days $2,628.00 $7,884.00 $1,890.97 $5,672.91 $1,877.00 $5,631.00 May-23 $1,935.00 $5,805.00 60-120 days $2,168.00 $6,504.00 2-45 days

YAMAHA ALTO SAX W/CASE YAS-26 2 $2,598.00 $5,196.00 Jan. 2023 $972.78 $1,945.56 1 Week $966.95 $1,933.90 30-60 days $2,569.50 $5,139.00 $1,108.97 $2,217.94 $895.80 $1,791.60 45 days $1,340.00 $2,680.00 30-60 days $1,272.00 $2,544.00 2-45 days
YAMAHA BARI SAX W/CASE YBS-480 2 $4,908.00 $9,816.00 Spring 2023 $5,241.50 $10,483.00 1 Week $4,580.65 $9,161.30 30-90 days $6,614.00 $13,228.00 $4,572.97 $9,145.94 $4,765.00 $9,530.00 May-23 $4,659.00 $9,318.00 30-90 days $5,241.50 $10,483.00 2-45 days
YAMAHA CLAVINOVA DIGITAL 
PIANO W/BENCH

CLP735B 1 No Bid No Bid $2,186.99 $2,186.99 Nov. No Bid No Bid $3,084.00 $3,084.00 No Bid No Bid $3,699.00 $3,699.00 Apr-23 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$58,574.85 $77,508.60 No Bid $56,919.60 $54,846.00

AWARD BY ITEM:

FOX BASSOON W/CASE MODEL IV 1 $5,906.00 $5,906.00 May-23 $6,072.00 $6,072.00 1 Week $5,633.00 $5,633.00 90-180 days $6,560.00 $6,560.00 $5,873.69 $5,873.69 $6,370.00 $6,370.00 90 days $5,820.00 $5,820.00 11 months $7,510.00 $7,510.00 2-45 days

YANAGISAWA ALTO SAXOPHONE 
LACQUERED W/CASE

AWO1  3 $2,846.00 $8,538.00 Feb-23 $4,067.85 $12,203.55 1week $2,665.10 $7,995.30 30-90 days $3,451.60 $10,354.80 $2,639.97 $7,919.91 $2,763.86 $8,291.58 May-23 $3,520.00 $10,560.00 30-90 days $3,040.25 $9,120.75 2-45 days

FRANZ HOFFMAN PRELUDE CELLO 
OUTFIT

¾ SIZE 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,726.50 $3,453.00 No Bid No Bid $1,035.00 $2,070.00 30 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

ROLAND 88-KEY STAGE PIANO 
W/STAND AND CASE

RD-88 1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 Now $1,556.99 $1,556.99 Not Available $2,045.00 $2,045.00 30-60 days $1,676.00 $1,676.00 $1,199.97 $1,199.97 $1,251.38 $1,251.38 60 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

POLK AUDIO LEGEND BOOKSHELF 
SPEAKERS, BROWN WALNUT

L200 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,614.00 $1,614.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

MCADAMS METRONOME/TUNER 
WITH REMOTE

MODEL 40 1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 Now $1,004.96 $1,004.96 N/A $1,120.00 $1,120.00 30-60 days $1,319.00 $1,319.00 $1,119.97 $1,119.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,142.25 $1,142.25 2-45 days

WENGER TUBA STORAGE RACK – 
FUSION MAPLE

4 UNIT 2 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 6-8 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,169.00 $2,338.00 No Bid No Bid $1,562.09 $3,124.18 10-12 weeks No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Award total $4,800.00 $64,646.85 $7,995.30

Custodial   

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
 Bid Tab

RFQ 23/24

Musical Instruments

8/23/2022

Highlighted in Green below. Not awarding Cello or Speakers

Palen Music Center Music & Arts Washington Music Sales Center, Inc. Alamo Music Center Shar Products Company Alto Music Midwest Musical Imports
Columbia, MO Frederick, MD Wheaton, MD San Antonio, TX Ann Arbor, MI

YAMAHA TOTAL

Planet Cellular, Inc.
Pembroke Pines, FL McAllen, TX

Melhart Music Center
Middleton, NY Minneapolis, MN


