COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: RFQ 22/22
SUBJECT: Musical Instruments
DATE: 7/30/2021
SCHOOL/DEPT: Fine Arts
AWARDED TO: See Highlighted below
Alamo Music Center Washington Music Sales Center The Music Den Taylor Music Delgado Guitars Aviate Enterprises, Inc. Palen Music Center National Education Music Co. Brooks Mays Music Midwest Musical Imports
Instrument | QTY San Antonio, TX Wheaton, MD Randolph, Aberdeen, SD Nashville, T McClellan, CA Columbia, M Piscataway, NJ Dallas, TX Minneapolis, MN
Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO Unit Price Total ARO
0
Yamaha Baritone 6 |$1,844.94 ] $11,069.64 | 60days | $1,724.70 | $10,348.20 | 21-60 days | $1,884.48 | $11,306.88 | 4-6 months | $1,744.00 | $10,464.00 | Mid-Nov $2,309.46 | $13,856.76 | Not provided | $1,760.00 | $10,560.00 | $44,501.00 | $1,859.11 | $11,154.66 | 45-60 days No Bid $1,675.00 $10,050.00 Nov 2021
Yamaha Saxophone | 2 | $1,944.26 | $3,888.52 | 30-60 | $1,766.5 | $3,533.10 | 21-45 days [ $1.930.24 | $3,860.48 | 4-6 months [ $1.788.00 | $3,576.00 | Dec $2,433.78 | $4,867.56 | Not provided | $1,855.00 | $3,710.00 | $44,515.00| $1,904.25 | $3,808.50 | 45-60 days No Bid $1,754.00 $3,508.00 Nov 2021
TOTAL Yamaha $14,958.16 $13,881.30 $15,167.36 $14,040.00 No Bid $18,724.32 $14,270.00 $14,963.16 $13,558.00
3060
Selmer Clarinet 8 | $76295 | $6,103.60 | days | $755.05 | $6,040.40 |21-45 days | $822.42 | $6,579.36 | 30days | $759.00 | $6,072.00 | 15days | $956.52 | $7,652.16 | 30days |$1,082.10| $8,656.80 | Not provided | $814.00 | $6,512.00 | AsAP | $811.35 | $6,490.80 | 30 days $790.79 $6,326.32 30 Days $787.00 $6,296.00 Aug
30-60
Selmer Alto Sax 1 |$1,32062 $1,320.62 | days | $1,315.20 | $1,315.20 | 21-45 days | $1,432.60 | $1,432.60 | 30days |$1,322.00| $1,322.00 | 30days [s$1,667.50 | $1,667.50 | 30days |s$1,861.49 | $1,861.49 | Not provided | $1,418.00| $1,418.00 | 8/20/2021 | $1,413.32| $1,413.32 | 45-60days | s$1,37750 | s$1,377.50 30 Days $1,350.00 $1,350.00 Late Aug
30-60
Selmer Tenor Sax | 1 |$1,567.60 | $1,587.60 | days | $1,517.20 | $1,517.00 | 2145 days|$1,711.44| $1,711.44 | 30days |$1,577.00| $1,577.00 | 30days |$1,987.09] $1,987.00 | 30days |$2,227.36 | $2,227.36 | Not provided |$1,695.00| $1,695.00 | 8/21/2021 | 1,688.41 | $1,688.41 | 45-60days | s164562 | 164562 30 Days $1,615.00 $1,615.00 Late Aug
TOTAL Selmer $9,02091 $8,872.80 $9,723.40 $8,971.00 $11,306.75 $12,745.65 $9,625.00 $9,592.53 $9,349.44 $9,270.00
=)
Burkart Piccolo 2 |$2,449.13| $4,898.26 | months | $2,220.00 | $4,440.00 | 21-45 days | $2,104.87 | $4,200.74 | 30 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
30-60
Holton French Horm | 2 |$3,445.37 | $6,890.74 | days | $3,511.80 | $7,023.60 |21-60 days | $3,825.33 | $7,650.66 | 30 days |$3,505.00| $7,010,00 | 15 days |$4,229.93| $8,450.86 | 30 Days |$4,825.77] $9,651.54 | Not provided |$3,788.00| $7,576.00 | nsap |$3,773.83| s7,547.66 | 30days | $367820 | $7,356.40 30 days $3,500.00 $7,000.00 Nov 2021
[TOTAL Award $6,890.74 $22,754.10 $4.209.74




