COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: RFP 21/21
SUBJECT: Athletic Field Improvements at Battle, Hickman and Rock Bridge High Schools
DATE: 9/29/2020
SCHOOL/DEPT: BHS, HHS, RBHS
AWARDED TO: Bid Package 1 to S&A; Bid Package 2 and Alt 1 & 2 to Fieldturf
Vendor Bid Package 1 Bid Package 2 Bid Package 2A Bid Package 1 & 2/2A

BHS HHS RBHS Total BHS | HHS RBHS | Total BHS | HHS | RBHS | Total BHS | HHS i RBHS I Total Alt 1 Alt 2

g&A Equipment & Builders, LLC $468,587.61 |  $261,544.01 | $423,714.12 | $1,153,845.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid $23,037.76 | $63,179.28
L_Jlton MO

;‘;‘]‘t’;‘;'l'f ”; f:‘;ei“‘a nada No Bid $553,128.00 | $241,785.00 | $566,630.00 | $1,361,543.00 | $499,844.00 | $217,161.00 | $511,758.00 | $1,228,763.00 | $1,272,962.00 | $613,298.00 | $1,311,498.00 | $3,197,758.00 | $17,735.00 | $32,495.00
ﬂf;ﬁ;‘mf;g”m Construction $566,224.00 |  $367,507.00 | $600,212.00 | $1,533,943.00 No Bid $592,563.00 | $349,013.00 | $632,264.00 | $1,573,840.00 | $1,158,787.00 | $716,520.00 | $1,232,476.00 | $3,107,783.00 | $15,000.00 | $32,164.00
|Byrne & Jones Construction : : N :
B incton. M0 $523,308.00 |  $253,540.00 | $555,846.00 | $1,332,694.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $22,000.00|  No Bid
A-T.G. Ram Industries, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,197,000.00 | $536,000.00 | $1,275,000.00 | $3,008,000.00 | $12,000.00 | $11,500.00
Sprinturf, LLC y ) ) )
Drel Teend. SC No Bid No Bid $455,400.00 | $216,400.00 | $480,200.00 | $1,152,000.00 No Bid NoBid | $32,600.00
Shaw Sports Turf No Bid No Bid $449,143.00 | $253,922.00 | $527,053.00 | $1,230,118.00% No Bid NoBid | $37,951.00

*Total is different than listed on bid of $1,280,117.00




