COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: RFQ 20/21
SUBJECT: Nutrition Service Equipment
DATE: 8/12/2019
SCHOOL/DEPT: Nut. Svs.
AWARDED TO: See Below in Green

Section/Item Qty FORD HOTE'L SUPPLY INDEX RESTAUBANT SUPPLY PUEBLO HOTEL SUPPLY DOUGLAS EQUIPMENT
Columbia, MO Kansas City, MO Pueblo, CO Bluefield, WV
Unit Price | Total Cost | UnitPrice | Total Cost Unit Price | Total Cost Unit Price | Total Cost
Item 1a: Ice Machine (replacing QY0454A) JMS
Cost for ice maker with bin 1 $3,731.83 | $3,731.83 $3,965.00 | $3,965.00 $3,019.17 | $3,019.17 $3,249.83 | $3,249.83
Brand Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowac
IYT0450A, D400 IYT0450A, D400 IYT0450A (per email D400), IYT0450A, D400
Model # confirmed price per email
Warranty 3-5 3-5 3-5 3-5
OR Cost for ice maker with dispenser | 1 $5,950.03 | $5,950.03 $6,086.00 |  $6,086.00 $4,813.78 |  $4,813.78 | No Bid
Brand Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc
IYT0450A, SPA310 IYT0450A, SPA310 SPA310, per email [YTO4504,
Model # confirmed price per email
Warranty 3-5 3-5 3-5
Manufacturer Filter $220.32 $224.00 $169.34 No Bid
Accessory-bagger $456.16 includes bin upgrade $340.00 N/A No Bid
Accessory-scoop $73.75 included $49.55 No Bid
. i 95, water disconnect by CPS 0.00 632.50 575 (if not included no inside deli
Removal of existing unit ¥ Y ¥ ¥ $575( elivery)
Installation & Startup per unit $488.25 (includes removal) [$850 (stacking of head on bin only) $1,150.00 NA
Item 1b: Ice Machine (replacing ICE0320HA4) RBE
Cost for ice maker with bin 1 $3,649.43 | $3,649.43 $3,700.00 | $3,700.00 $3,133.00 |  $3,133.00 $3,179.29 | $3,179.29
Brand Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowac
IYT0402A, D420 IYT0420A, D420 IYT0420A (per email D570), IYT0420H
Model # confirmed price per email
Warranty 3-5 3-5 3-5 3-5
OR Cost for ice maker with dispenser | 1 $5,358.69 | $5,358.69 $5,435.00 |  $5,435.00 $4,831.60 |  $4,831.60 | No Bid
Brand Manitowoc Manitowoc Manitowoc
SPA310, per email IYT0420A,

Model # IYT0402A, SPA160 1YT04204, SPA160 confirmed will hold price
Warranty 3-5 3-5 3-5
Manufacturer Filter $220.32 $224.00 $169.34 No Bid
Accessory-bagger $336.75 $340.00 $258.82 No Bid
Accessory-scoop $73.75 included $49.55 No Bid
Removal of existing unit $95, water disconnect by CPS $0.00 $632.50 $575 (if not included no inside delivery)
Item 2: Commercial Heated Holding Cabinet (equal to Metro C5 519-
HFC-U)
Cost (WBE, PKE, RWE, Benton) | 4 $1,809.37 $7,237.48 $1,746.00 $6,984.00 $2,019.20 $8,076.80 $1,758.55 $7,034.20
Brand Metro Metro Metro Metro
Model # C519-HFC-U C519-HFC-U C519-HFC-U C519-HFC-U




Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Item 3: Commerical Reach in Freezer (NHE) |
Cost (top compressor) | 1 $5471.30 | $5,471.30 $6,491.00 |  $6,491.00 $6,293.63 |  $6,293.63 $5,685.24 | $5,685.24
Brand Turbo Air Norlake TRUE TRUE
Model # M3F72-3-N NF803SSS/0 T-72F-HC STGF-35
Warranty 3-5 3-5 3or5 3-5
Cost (bottom compressor) ] 1 $6,191.72 | $6,191.72 $5,614.00 |  $5,614.00 NA | NA $5,316.56 | $5,316.56
Brand Turbo Air Norlake NA TRUE
Model # TSF-725D-N NLF72-S NA T-72F-HC
Warranty 3-5 3-5 NA 3-5
Installation Cost $270.00 $0.00 $827.20 $1200 must fit through door
Numebr of shelves included 9 12 6 9
Shelf Unit Cost $58 (includes clips) $68.15 $68.12 No bid
Item 4: Commercial Prep Table Sink (WMS) equal to John Boos
PB18234-1D24 or Advance Tabco 93-61-18-24R)
Cost | 1 $536.48 $536.48 $1,078.00 $1,078.00 $1,409.65 $1,409.65 $1,970.46 $1,970.46
Brand John Boos John Boos Advance Tabco Advance Tabco
Model # 1B18244-1D24R-X 1PB1824-1D24R 93-61-18-24R 93-61-18-24R
Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Optional - Fischer faucets and drain valves, wall mount pre-rinse sprayer w/ add $297.81 (_prerinse) $90.49 $345 pre-rinse, $105 drain valve $317.76 $653.50
on faucet drain valve ea.
Item 5: Commercial Prep Table Sink (HHS) equal to Eagle Group
SMPT30108
Cost | 1 $4,151.07 $4,151.07 $4,985.00 $4,985.00 $3,891.37 $3,891.37 $3,708.29 $3,708.29
Brand John Boos Eagle Group Advance Tabco Eagle
Model # ST4R5-30108SSK SMPT30108 TVKS-308 SMPT30108
Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Item 6: 4-Compartment Sink (WMS) equal to Advance Tabco 93-84-80-
36RL
Sink without accessories | 1 $3,720.50 $3,720.50 $5,042.00 $5,042.00 $4,137.86 $4,137.86 $4,179.74 $4,179.74
Delivery & Install cost per unit | 1 $4,860.90 $4,860.90 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,728.00 $2,728.00 $2,480.00 $2,480.00
Brand John Boos Advance Tabco Advance Tabco Advance Tabco
Model # 4PB2028-2D36 93-84-80-36RL 93-84-80-36RL 93-84-80-36RL
Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Optional - Wall mount pre-rinse sprayer w/ add on faucet $297.81 $345.00 $442.08 $457.30
Optional - Regular faucet $111.08 $134.00 $100.77 $457.30

$95.00 all mechanical
Optional - Removal of existing disconnected by CPS $450.00 $575.00 $457.30
Item 7: Hand Sink (WMS) equal to John Boos PBHS-W-1410-SSLR | | | |
Cost | 1 $12432 | $124.32 $138.75 | $138.75 $297.00 | $297.00 $201.44 | $201.44
Brand John Boos John Boos Advance Tabco Advance Tabco
Model # PBHS-W-1410-SSLR PBHS-W-1410-SSLR-X 7-PS-66-NF-1X 7-PS-EC-SP
Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Item 8: Polymer Shelving Unit(WMS) equal to metro max 1
Cost 4' wide | 1 $864.21 $864.21 $715.65 $715.65 NA NA No Bid
Cost 6' wide | 1 $1,086.41 $1,086.41 $879.30 $879.30 $1,132.37 $1,132.37 No Bid
Brand Metro Metro Metro
Model # Metro Max I MQ2448G/MQ2472G TTS6NA
Warranty lifetime 1-15 NA
Item 9: Shelf (HHS)equal to advance tabco WS-10-96-16 | | | |
Cost | 1 $196.78 | $196.78 $379.00 | $379.00 $220.85 | $220.85 $1,877.79 | $1,877.79
Brand John Boos Advance Tabco Advance Tabco Advance Tabco
Model # BHS1296-1 WS-10-96-16 WS-10-96-16 WS-10-96-16
Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Item 10: Commercial Prep Table(WMS) equal t advance tabco SLAG-
308.X or John Boos ST6-3096GSK $2,578.18 $1,013.00 $1,585.10 $892.02
Cost 3' wide | 1 $862.86 $862.86 $329.00 $329.00 $542.30 $542.30 $356.07 $356.07




Cost 8' wide ] 1 $1,715.32 | $1,715.32 $684.00 |  $684.00 $1,042.80 |  $1,042.80 $535.95 | $535.95
Brand John Boos John Boos Advance Tabco Advance Tabco
Model # ST6-3096GSK ST6-3036GSK-X/ST6-3096GSK-X SLAG SLAG-303-X/SLAG308-X
Warranty 1 1 NA NA
Item 11: Salad Bar (RBEx2, NHE & Grant) Cambro or equal | No Bid
Cost 4 $2,522.52 | $10,090.08 $2,496.00 | $9,984.00 $1,536.18 |  $6,144.72 | No Bid
Brand Cambro Cambro Cambro
Model # VBRL6110 VBRL6110 VBRL5
Warranty see attached 1 NA
Optional - Freeze buffet chiller pack $95.55 (5 per unit) $98.60 $89.12
Optional - under storage $501.64 Model VBRU6110 $2989 (not available in low) $220.46
Optional - merchandising sign holder $129.39 $133.50 $120.68
Optional - Assembly $50.00 $50.00 $632.50
Item 12: Milk Cooler (NHE) |
Cost | 1 $3,526.26 | $3,526.26 $3,490.00 | $3,490.00 $3,767.00 |  $3,767.00 $2,168.17 | $2,168.17
Brand Beverage Air Beverage Air Beverage Air TRUE
Model # SMF58HC-1-W SMF58HC-1-W SMF58HC-1-W TMC-58-MC
Warranty 3-5 3-5 20r3 3-5

TOTAL AWARD $10,049.38 $7,863.30 $14,091.50 $6,412.41




