COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Tab
BID NO: RFQ 20/54
SUBJECT: Custom Computers
DATE: 1/28/2020
SCHOOL/DEPT: Tech Svs
AWARDED TO: HyperTec
Hypertec CDW-G |Horus Group| Adorama SHI Mvation Smart IT | JourneyEd [ Mvation Office KC Premier [ Howard
Essentials
Dell CTO 3431
Specifications Met
BASE PRICE $ 1,122.50 | $ 1,149.00 | § 1,219.58 | No Bid $ 1,292.15 |8 1,277.49 [ $ 1,279.00 | No Bid $ 1,399.58 | No Bid $ 1,929.00
Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty $ 1,122.50 | $ 1,149.00 | $§ 1,219.58 | No Bid $ 1,292.15 | No Bid $ 1,279.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,229.00 Did not
Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty $ 1,149.26 | $ 1,165.00 | § 1,219.58 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,328.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 2,229.00 | submit bid
Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty $ 1,175.50 | $ 1,189.00 | § 1,219.58 | § 1,329.50 | $ 1,354.50 [ $ 1,277.49 [ $ 1,349.00 | § 1,379.78 | $ 1,399.58 | $ 1,420.00 [ $ 2,229.00 form
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty $ 1,212.97 | $ 1,225.00 | $ 1,260.63 | § 1,374.25 | $ 1,398.60 | No Bid $ 1,419.00 | $ 1,421.18 | No Bid $ 1,468.00 | § 2,229.00
Awarded Unit Cost




