
RFQ No. 17/74 DELL COMPUTERS                       

3/16/17 @3:00PM

BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

CDW-G Adorama Shi International

#1

Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty

#2

Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty

# 3
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 998.00$                     $                   1,120.50 1,200.00$                    

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty - - Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty - - Included

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 998.00$                    included Included

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,028.00$                 - 1,245.00$                    

#4
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 386.40$                    622.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 386.40$                    Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 399.00$                    686.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 414.00$                    724.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 434.00$                    788.00$                       

#5
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 575.40$                    667.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 575.40$                    Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 633.15$                    731.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 663.15$                    769.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 712.15$                    833.00$                       

#6
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 740.25$                     $                   1,026.25  $                      864.00 

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 740.25$                    - Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 775.25$                    - 909.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 825.25$                    - 984.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 885.25$                    - 1,060.00$                    

#7
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 243.00$                    269.50$                       262.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 243.00$                    - -

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 253.00$                    - 288.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 268.00$                    - 307.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 276.00$                    - 319.00$                       

#8
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 338.00$                    444.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 338.00$                    Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 358.00$                    469.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 388.00$                    488.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 392.00$                    501.00$                       

LATITUDE 3100 (2 N 1) CHROME with REQUIRED GOOGLE EDU MANAGEMENT CONSOLE LICENSE

No Bid 

LATITUDE 3190 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

No Bid 

LATITUDE 3400 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

No Bid 

LATITUDE 5500 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

LATITUDE 3100 CHROME - CLAMSHELL with REQUIRED GOOGLE EDU MANAGEMENT CONSOLE LICENSE

OPTIPLEX 3070

No Bid No Bid No Bid 

PRECISION TOWER 3430 Small Form Factor

Computers: CDW-G.          Accessories: See below in green.

OPTIPLEX 3070 MINI TOWER

No Bid No Bid No Bid 
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#9
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 486.00$                     $                      541.00  $                      573.00 

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 486.00$                    -  Included 

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 492.00$                    -  $                      634.00 

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 516.00$                    -  $                      670.00 

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 549.00$                    -  $                      731.00 

#10
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 621.74$                    586.25$                       713.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 621.74$                    - Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 679.00$                    - 777.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 713.00$                    - 815.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty w// ADP (DELL OEM) 787.50$                    - 879.00$                       

#11 LATITUDE 5300 (2 N 1)
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 929.25$                     $                      934.75 960.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 929.25$                    - Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 976.50$                    - 1,004.00$                    

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 1,039.50$                 - 1,080.00$                    

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,076.25$                 - 1,155.00$                    

#12
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 945.00$                    1,019.50$                    847.00$                       

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 945.00$                    - Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 977.00$                    - 891.00$                       

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 1,037.00$                 - 967.00$                       

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,090.00$                 - 1,043.00$                    

13 Monitor 20" E‐Series ‐ E2616H (Hieght Adjust Only) 79.80$                     No Bid 89.00$                        
14 Monitor 22" E‐Series  ‐ E2216H (Hieght Adjust Only) 91.35$                     No Bid 103.00$                      
15 Monitor 22" P‐Series ‐ P2219H (Height, Tilt, Swival, Pivot)  136.50$                   141.75$                      162.00$                      
16 Monitor 24" P‐Series ‐ P2419H (Height, Tilt, Swival, Pivot)  170.00$                   156.75$                      199.00$                      

17
Monitor 22" P‐Series ‐ P2219HC (Height, Tilt, Swival, Pivot) w/USB C

141.75$                   164.75$                      140.00$                      

18

Monitor 24" P‐Series ‐ P2419HC (Height, Tilt, Swival, Pivot) ‐ w/USB 

C 181.00$                   219.00$                      185.00$                      
19 WD15 ‐ 180W Docking Station 193.00$                   206.75$                      196.00$                      
20 WD19 ‐ *** New Dock 2019 *** 198.00$                   No Bid 167.00$                      
21 WD19TB ‐ (Thunderbolt)  *** New Dock 2019 *** 234.00$                   No Bid 240.00$                      
22 DA3100 ‐ USB Mini Port Replicator  121.00$                   No Bid 73.00$                        
23 USB SoundBar AC511 (318‐2885) 30.00$                     26.50$                        26.00$                        
24 USB Slim DVD+/‐RW Drive DW316 (429‐AAUX) 40.50$                     36.00$                        44.00$                        
25 Portable Backup Hard Drive 1TB (784‐BBBE) 56.99$                     No Bid 53.00$                        
26 Optiplex Micro Vertical Stand (482‐BBBR) 13.50$                     76.50$                        15.00$                        
27 Optiplex Micro VESA Mount (482‐BBBP) 20.00$                     No Bid 22.00$                        

28

Optiplex Micro All in One Mount desktop to monitor kit (482‐

BBBO) 68.00$                     38.25$                        37.00$                        
29 Optiplex Micro Console with DVD‐RW (492‐BBBS) 60.00$                     No Bid 66.00$                        
30 Wireless Keyboard and Mouse Combo KM714 (332‐1396) 60.00$                     69.00$                        66.00$                        
31 MS116 Wired Mouse (275‐BBBW) 13.50$                     15.50$                        15.00$                        
32 KB216 Wired Multi‐Media Keyboard English (580‐ADJC) 13.50$                     14.50$                        15.00$                        
33 Monitor 20" E‐Series ‐ E2616H (Hieght Adjust Only) No Bid No Bid 89.00$                        

LATITUDE 3190 (2 N 1) Windows

LATITUDE 3390 (2 N 1) Windows

LATITUDE 5300 - Clamshell Windows


