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CDW-G MVAtion Worldwide Sterling

#1
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 505.00$                    696.74$                       545.05$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 505.00$                    No bid 545.05$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 525.00$                    No bid 560.84$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 546.00$                    Included 583.95$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 588.00$                    No bid 626.17$                                         

#2
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 484.00$                    651.19$                       460.45$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 484.00$                    No Bid 460.45$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 504.00$                    No Bid 477.86$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 525.00$                    Included 470.68$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 556.00$                    No Bid 549.86$                                         

# 3
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 494.00$                     $                      663.79 494.41$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 494.00$                    No Bid 494.41$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 515.00$                    No Bid 510.13$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 535.00$                    Included 533.14$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 567.00$                    No Bid 575.20$                                         

#4
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 992.00$                     $                   1,011.75 1,040.26$                                      

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 992.00$                    No Bid 1,040.26$                                      

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 998.00$                    No Bid 1,047.58$                                      

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 1,002.00$                 Included 1,053.88$                                      

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,021.00$                 No Bid 1,095.53$                                      

#5
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 367.54$                    619.47$                       392.70$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 384.00$                    No Bid 392.70$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 405.00$                    No Bid 451.88$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 416.00$                    Included 483.88$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 436.00$                    No Bid 537.21$                                         

#6
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 588.00$                     $                      846.09 625.31$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 588.00$                    No Bid 625.31$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 623.00$                    No Bid 680.53$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 666.00$                    Included 713.32$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 712.00$                    No Bid 768.00$                                         

#7
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 697.00$                    1,084.59$                    815.72$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 722.00$                    No Bid 815.72$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 743.00$                    No Bid 854.22$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 799.00$                    Included 919.68$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 858.00$                    No Bid 985.12$                                         

#8
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 237.00$                    244.40$                       217.81$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 242.00$                    Included 217.81$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 244.00$                    No Bid -

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 257.00$                    No Bid 246.22$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 266.00$                    No Bid 257.33$                                         

#9
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 302.00$                     $                      327.02 

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 304.00$                    Included

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 312.00$                    No Bid

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 329.00$                    No Bid

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 339.00$                    No Bid

#10
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 436.00$                    602.10$                       483.95$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 441.00$                    Included 483.95$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 445.00$                    No Bid 538.37$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 454.00$                    No Bid 570.71$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty w// ADP (DELL OEM) 490.00$                    No Bid 624.59$                                         

LATITUDE 3180 CHROME - CLAMSHELL with REQUIRED GOOGLE EDU MANAGEMENT CONSOLE LICENSE

OPTIPLEX 3060 MINI TOWER XCTO (210‐AFXL) WITH VGA AND 128GB SSD

OPTIPLEX 3060 MICRO XCTO (210‐AFXJ) WITH 128GB SSD #727668958

OPTIPLEX 3060 MICRO XCTO (210-AFXJ) WITH VGA AND 128GB SSD #728011476

PRECISION TOWER 3420  Small Form Factor

LATITUDE 3180 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

LATITUDE 3490 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

LATITUDE 5590 - WINDOWS - CLAMSHELL

LATITUDE 3189 (2 N 1) CHROME with REQUIRED GOOGLE EDU MANAGEMENT CONSOLE LICENSE

 No Bid 

LATITUDE 3189 (2 N 1) Windows
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#11 LATITUDE 3390 (2 N 1) Windows
Specifications Met

BASE PRICE 629.00$                     $                      682.28 706.82$                                         

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 629.00$                    Included 706.82$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty 644.00$                    No Bid 719.36$                                         

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 652.00$                    No Bid 751.90$                                         

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 686.00$                    No Bid 806.12$                                         

#12
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 1,079.00$                 1,267.72$                    1,155.03$                                      

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty 1,079.00$                 Included 115.03$                                         

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty N/A No Bid -

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 1,138.00$                 No Bid 1,223.49$                                      

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,196.00$                 No Bid 1,280.41$                                      

#13
Specifications Met 

BASE PRICE 1,138.00$                 1,499.40$                    1,173.09$                                      

Option 1 - 1 Year Onsite Warranty N/A No Bid -

Option 2 - 2 Year Basic Warranty N/A No Bid -

Option 3 - 3 Year Basic Warranty Base Included -

Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 1,185.00$                 No Bid 1,229.78$                                      

LATITUDE 7390 (2 N 1)

LATITUDE 7390 - Clamshell Windows


