
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

QTY
Southern Computer

Warehouse 
Marietta, GA

Technoformers 
Silver Spring, MO

TIERNEY- St. Paul, 
MN

KCAV - Kansas 
City, MO

HOWARD 
TECHNOLOGY 

SOLUTIONS- Laurel, 
MS

Schillers Audio 
Visual               St. 

Louis, MO 
CI SELECT - St Louis, 

MO

1-25 $1,994.38 $1,888.90 $2,057.97 $2207 for 1, 
$1945 for 2

$2,615.00 $1,846.32

26-50 $1,994.38 $1,868.90 $2,057.97 $1,936.00 $2,615.00 $1,679.58
51-75 $1,994.38 $1,848.90 $2,057.97 $1,936.00 $2,615.00 $1,670.83
76-100 $1,994.38 $1,828.90 $2,057.97 $1,936.00 $2,615.00 $1,662.18
101-200 $1,994.38 $1,820.90 $2,057.97 $1,936.00 $2,615.00 $1,653.61

1-25 $2,501.17 $2,343.68 $2250 for 1, 
$1989 for 2

$1,846.32

26-50 $2,491.17 $2,343.68 $1,979.00 $1,679.58
51-75 $2,471.17 $2,343.68 $1,979.00 $1,670.83
76-100 $2,461.17 $2,343.68 $1,979.00 $1,662.18
101-200 $2,451.17 $2,343.68 $1,979.00 $1,653.61

1-25 $2,094.39 $1,987.50 $2,166.52 $2453 for 1, 
$2359 for 2

$2,675.00 $1,953.68

26-50 $2,094.39 $1,967.50 $2,166.52 $2,345.00 $2,675.00 $1,786.39
51-75 $2,094.39 $1,947.50 $2,166.52 $2,335.00 $2,675.00 $1,777.08
76-100 $2,094.39 $1,927.50 $2,166.52 $2,323.00 $2,675.00 $1,767.88
101-200 $2,094.39 $1,917.50 $2,166.52 $2,311.00 $2,675.00 $1,758.76

1-25 $2,599.50 $2,452.23 $2488 for 1, 
$2359 for 2

$1,953.68

26-50 $2,589.50 $2,452.23 $2,345.00 $1,786.39
51-75 $2,579.50 $2,452.23 $2,335.00 $1,777.08
76-100 $2,569.50 $2,452.23 $2,323.00 $1,767.88
101-200 $2,559.50 $2,452.23 $2,311.00 $1,758.76

1-25 $127.60 $159.95 $105.00 $103.50 $153.00 $121.00 $103.78
26-50 $127.60 $157.95 $102.00 $103.20 $153.00 $121.00 $103.23
51-75 $127.60 $155.95 $102.00 $102.15 $153.00 $121.00 $102.67
76-100 $127.60 $153.95 $99.99 $102.15 $153.00 $121.00 $102.13
101-200 $127.60 $151.95 $99.99 $101.50 $153.00 $121.00 $101.59

No Bid No Bid

Chief Wall Mount

CI Select

InFocus J Touch INF6500E Option 
A (3 Year Warranty)

No Bid

InFocus J Touch INF6500E Option 
B (5 Year Warranty)

No Bid No Bid

InFocus J Touch INF6500EAG 
Option A (3 Year Warranty)

InFocus J Touch INF6500EAG 
Option B (5 Year Warranty)

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
 Bid Result

RFQ 19/03

Infocus Interactive Display System and Chief Mounts

4/12/2017

Tech Svs


