COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result
BID NO: RFQ 18/70
SUBJECT: Welding Equipment
DATE: 1/30/2018
SCHOOL/DEPT: cAce
AWARDED TO: Matheson
Tri-State Welding & Ahrens Steel & Welding
& Matheson S3 Smith Co. Equipment Praxair Distribution, Inc. Airgas Tiles In Style, Inc. Paxton/Patterson Supplies
Columbia, MO Mexico, MO Kahoka, MO Springfield, MO Holts Summit, MO Willowbrook, IL Alsip, IL Columbia, MO
Item Unit Price Total | unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
28 || $3,606.00 | $100,968.00 | s3666.64 | s10266592 s368261 | 10311308 | s3763.83 | st05387.24 | s418670 | s117,07.60]  s5323.50 $149,058.00 $3,927.40 $109,967.20 | $3,724.42 | $104,283.76
Miller XMT 350 CC/CV Multiprocess Wel
Miller XMT 350 Mpa Dinse Welder 15 | $428000 | 96420000 | 435122 | 6526830 | 9437007 | 6555255 | s4,465.9 $66,989.40 $4,968.58 | $7452870 ]  $6,883.50 $103,252.50 $4,660.66 $69,909.90 | $441979 | $66,296.85
Miller 5-74 Mpa Plus 15 [ 5191300 | s28eos00 | s1oa555 | sa018325 | s105402 | 52931030 | s1,997.23 $29,958.45 52,2150 | $3332385 ] 311870 $46,780.50 $2,083.91 31,5865 [ $1,976.21 | $29,643.15
3 | 777500 | s2332500 | s700593 | s23717.79 | s7.94038 | s2zsar14 | ss 11596 $24,347.88 $9,027.65 | $27,082.95 |  $12,733.50 $38,200.50 $8,468.19 52540457 || $8,030.53 |  $24,091.59
Miller PKG Continuum 350 MIG Runner
Miller Gas Valve Kit for Xmt 350 18 $78.00 | $1,404.00 $79.59 $1,432.62 $39.93 $718.74 $81.70 $1,470.60 $90.88 $1,635.84 $143.00 $2,574.00 $85.24 $1,534.32 $85.34 $1,536.12
Miller TIG Wireless Foot Control & 14-Pill 18 | $517.00 |  $9,306.00 552563 | $946134 | $527.92 $9,502.56 $539.60 $9,712.80 $600.21 $10,803.78 $864.50 $15,561.00 $563.02 $10,134.36 $533.91 $9,610.38
Miller TIG Power Cable Adaptor 18 $21.00 $378.00 $42.16 $758.88 $37.42 $673.56 $38.26 4685.68 $35.96 $647.08 $59.80 $1,076.40 No Bid 54111 $739.98
Miller TIG Accessory kit 18 $14.00 $252.00 $21.00 $378.00 $36.67 $660.06 $37.48 $674.64 $22.29 $401.22 $78.00 $1,404.00 No Bid $39.14 $704.52
Miller TIG Flowmeter Regulator 18 $57.50 | $1,035.00 $70.19 $1,63.42 $69.40 $1,249.20 $62.07 $1,117.26 $66.68 $1,200.24 $98.80 $1,778.40 No Bid $74.09 $1,333.62
Miller Insight Core 14-pin Module 37 § $840.00 | $31,080.00 | 485495 | $31,633.15 ] $858.67 31,7079 | $1462.77 $54,122.49 $1,16875 | $43243.75 ]  $1,258.40 $46,560.80 $1,526.25 45647125 | $1,230.27 | $45519.99
Miller Coolmate 3 115V, CE 15 [ $601.00 | $9,015.00 61161 | $9,174.15 | $614.27 $9,214.05 $627.86 $9,417.90 $698.39 | $10,475.85 $986.70 $14,800.50 $655.11 $9,826.65 $621.26 $9,318.90
Miller Weldcraft W-250, Braided Rubb
Her Weldcra raded Rubberg 39 $65.00 $1,950.00 $131.15 303450 | s13173 $3,951.90 $134.64 $4,039.20 $126.56 $3,796.80 $815.10 $24,453.00 $142.20 $4,266.00 $84.23 $2,526.90
12.5, Torch Package
15 | sas100 | s6,765.00 54592 | s6888.30 | s461.26 $6,918.90 $553.91 $8,308.65 $553.91 48,308.65 $442.00 $6,630.00 No Bid No Bid
Bernard water cool MIG Guns 350 amp
Bernard air cooled MIG Guns (400 amp
" 4 | $2300 | $9,589.00 52688 | so755.84 | 22786 $9,797.98 $201.13 $12,518.59 $273.66 | $11,767.38 $474.50 $20,403.50 No Bid $203.88 48,766.84
15
TOTAL $287,962.00 $295,515.46 $296,254.81 $328,753.78 $344,443.89 $472,533.10 $318,772.90 $304,372.60




