
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

1 No Bid No Bid $7,332.07 $7,332.07 $8,715.50 $8,715.50 $5,148.00 $5,148.00 $8,347.85 $8,347.85 No Bid $8,599.50 $8,599.50 $8,734.25 $8,734.25 $7,795.00 $7,795.00 No Bid No Bid

1 $15,050.00 $15,050.00 $13,286.47 $13,286.47 $14,753.42 $14,753.42 $15,152.62 $15,152.62 $15,452.88 $15,452.88 $14,110.11 $14,110.11 $14,545.16 $14,545.16 $14,014.25 $14,014.25 $24,150.00 $24,150.00 $16,624.00 $16,624.00 $16,693.38 $16,693.38 $15,152.39 $15,152.39

1 $20,752.50 $20,752.50 $17,797.42 $17,797.42 $19,690.61 $19,690.61 $20,091.60 $20,091.60 $20,699.36 $20,699.36 $18,900.70 $18,900.70 $19,432.53 $19,432.53 $17,801.82 $17,801.82 $32,200.00 $32,200.00 $22,268.00 $22,268.00 $22,323.22 $22,323.22 $20,025.24 $20,025.24

2 $4,007.00 $8,014.00 No Bid $4,548.39 $9,096.78 $5,150.00 $10,300.00 $5,296.83 $10,593.66 $4,764.38 $9,528.76 $4,357.12 $8,714.24 $4,430.34 $8,860.68 $6,210.00 $12,420.00 $4,845.00 $9,690.00 $10,223.86 $20,447.72 $4,620.00 $9,240.00

*Did not bid per specifications, did not inlcude freight

$77,504.25

Willowbrook, IL

Clark Food Service 

EquipmentSupplies on the Fly*

Kennesaw, GA

$51,893.90

Monsey, NYSalem, MO

Total $43,816.50 $59,464.32 $44,417.63$56,377.00

1. UltraSource Ultravac 500

2. Cleveland Range SGL30T1

3. Cleveland Range KGL40T
4. Hobart Legacy

$54,259.72 $49,276.25

Lancaster, PA

$42,691.93$50,887.42

See Below in Green

Item

QTY

Central Restaurant 

Products US Foods Chef's DepotTiles in Style, Inc.

Arrow Restaurant 

EquipmentSam Tell & Sons, Inc.

Indianapolis, IN Farmingdale, NY

1 Stop Electronics Center, 

In.c

Brooklyn, NY

Douglas Equipment

Bluefield, WV Montclair, CA

CACC

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Result

RFQ 18/67

Culinary Equipment

1/30/2018

Pueblo Hotel Supply

Pueblo, CO

$31,083.89

Ford Hotel Supply

Columbia, MO

$50,872.88


