
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
11 $2,294.12 $25,235.32 $3,730.00 $41,030.00 $2,627.50 $28,902.50 $2,121.84 $23,340.24
11 $58.82 $647.02 No Bid $56.35 $619.85 $47.37 $521.07
1 $11,582.35 $11,582.35 $21,955.00 $21,955.00 $11,269.00 $11,269.00 $9,100.00 $9,100.00
2 $170.59 $341.18 $2,133.00 $4,266.00 $1,502.50 $3,005.00 $298.65 $597.30
12 $64.71 $776.52 No Bid $563.45 $6,761.40 $186.25 $2,235.00
2 $15.97 $31.94 No Bid $19.70 $39.40 $15.95 $31.90
2 $15.16 $30.32 No Bid $13.20 $26.40 $32.89 $65.78
1 $2,199.00 $2,199.00 No Bid $1,287.30 $1,287.30 $1,014.40 $1,014.40
11 $258.82 $2,847.02 No Bid $223.35 $2,456.85 $176.00 $1,936.00
6 $1,523.53 $9,141.18 $2,196.00 $13,176.00 $1,126.90 $6,761.40 $909.97 $5,459.82

Tech Svs

Howard Technology

$80,427.00

Juniper 10GB -SR MM Optics

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Result

RFQ 18/43

Juniper Network Equipment

10/12/2017

Multi Mode OM3 LC-LC 3meter Patch Cable

JMA

Options QTY Hypertec USA PCM-G JMA

Juniper EX3300-48P (no subs)
Juniper DAC Cables EX-SFP 10GE-DAC-IM
Juniper QFX5100 (no subs)
Juniper 10GB -LR SM Optics

Single Mode SC-LC 5 Meter Patch Cable

$44,301.51

Juniper Support Next Day Service for QFX5100
Juniper Support -Core support for EX3300
Juniper EX-48-EFL

TOTAL $52,831.85 $61,129.10


