COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result
BID NO: RFQ 18/23
SUBJECT: Infocus Interactive Display System and Chief Mounts
DATE: 6/26/2017
SCHOOL/DEPT: Tech Svs
AWARDED TO: CI Select -5year

CLARY HOWARD FORD AUDIO
BUSINESS CCSs TECHNOLOGY VIDEO SYSTEM
QTY MACHINES - San] PRESENTATIONS, TIERNEY- St. B&H PHOTO, KCAYV - Kansas SOLUTIONS- LLC - Oklahoma | CI SELECT - St Louis,
Diego, CA Lenexa, KS Paul, MN New York, NY City, MO Laurel, MS City, OK MO
125 $3,040.00 $2.332.00 $2.321.22 no bid $1.815.00 $2.444.00 $2.455.00 $1,946.32
26-50 $2,895.00 $2,282.00 $2,296.26 no bid $1,810.00 $2,444.00 $2,455.00 $1,936.13
g‘;‘i’g:si(go\f::rwzzioé) 51-75 $2,795.00 $2,282.00 $2,271.83 no bid $1,810.00 $2,444.00 $2,455.00 $1,926.04
76-100 | $2,690.00 $2,282.00 $2,271.83 no bid $1,799.00 $2,444.00 $2,455.00 $1,916.06
101200 | $2,550.00 $2,282.00 $2,271.83 no bid $1,799.00 $2,444.00 $2,455.00 $1,906.19
125 $3,199.00 $2,611.00 $2,628.96 no bid $2,467.00 $2,755.00 $2,626.00 $1,946.32
26-50 $2,995.00 $2.560.00 $2,600.69 no bid $2,462.00 $2,755.00 $2,626.00 $1,936.13
g‘th‘i’g:sBJ(goﬁ(::r I\,':'/gf;‘iots) 51-75 $2,895.00 $2,560.00 $2,573.03 no bid $2,462.00 $2,755.00 $2,626.00 $1,926.04
76-100 | $2,790.00 $2.560.00 $2,573.03 no bid $2,451.00 $2,755.00 $2,626.00 $1,916.06
101200 | $2,650.00 $2,560.00 $2,573.03 no bid $2,451.00 $2,755.00 $2,626.00 $1,906.19
125 $3,440.00 $2,731.00 $2,740.79 no bid $1,878.00 $2,889.00 $2,689.00 $2,361.05
26-50 $3,295.00 $2,680.00 $2,711.32 no bid $1,873.00 $2,889.00 $2,689.00 $2,348.69
g‘;‘i’g:f(goﬁec:rwzs;?;)’\G 51-75 $3,195.00 $2,680.00 $2,682.47 no bid $1,873.00 $2,889.00 $2,689.00 $2,336.46
76-100 | $3,090.00 $2,680.00 $2,682.47 no bid $1,862.00 $2,889.00 $2,689.00 $2,324.35
101-200 | $2,950.00 $2,680.00 $2,682.47 no bid $1,862.00 $2,889.00 $2,689.00 $2,312.37
125 $3,499.00 $3,009.00 $3,048.53 no bid $2,524.00 $3,200.00 $2,972.00 $2,361.05
26-50 $3,395.00 $2,958.00 $3,015.75 no bid $2,519.00 $3,200.00 $2,972.00 $2,348.69
g‘th‘i’g:sBJ(goﬁ(::r IV':'/E?;??;?G 51-75 $3,295.00 $2,958.00 $2,983.66 no bid $2,519.00 $3,200.00 $2,972.00 $2,336.46
76-100 | $3,190.00 $2,958.00 $2,983.66 no bid $2,508.00 $3,200.00 $2,972.00 $2,324.35
101200 | $3,050.00 $2,958.00 $2,983.66 no bid $2,508.00 $3,200.00 $2,972.00 $2,312.37
125 $135.00 $108.00 $107.75 $128.50 $109.00 $135.00 $131.00 $103.78
26-50 $130.00 $104.00 $107.00 $128.50 $105.00 $135.00 $131.00 $103.23
Chief Wall Mount 51-75 $125.00 $104.00 $106.50 $128.50 $102.00 $135.00 $131.00 $102.67
76-100 $120.00 $104.00 $106.00 $128.50 $99.00 $135.00 $131.00 $102.13
101-200 $110.00 $104.00 $105.00 $128.50 $99.00 $135.00 $131.00 $101.59




