RFQ No. 18/03 DELL COMPUTERS

3/17 @3:00PM
Trinity3 CDW-G
#1 DELL LATITUDE 3189 11" 2-in-1 LAPTOP with 8GB
Specifications Met TBD Yes
BASE PRICE $ 472.00 | see below
Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 25+base bid | $ 484.00
Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty 49 + base bid | $ 534.00
Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 89+ base bid | $ 568.00
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 35 + base bid | $ 504.00
Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty 69 + base bid | $ 564.00
Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 109+base bid | $ 604.00
#2 DELL LATITUDE 5289 4GB 12" 2-in-1 LAPTOP with 4GB (8GB is Required)
Specifications Met TBD Yes
BASE PRICE $ 929.00 | see below
Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 25+base bid | $ 822.00
Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty 49 + base bid | $ 868.00
Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 89+ base bid | $ 923.00
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 35 + base bid | $ 854.00
Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty 69 + base bid | $ 923.00
Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 109+base bid | $ 996.00
#3 |DELL LATITUDE 3160 11.6" Touch Laptop with 8GB
Specifications Met No bid No Bid
BASE PRICE No bid No Bid
Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty No bid No Bid
Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty No bid No Bid
Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection No bid No Bid
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty No bid No Bid
Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty No bid No Bid
Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection No bid No Bid
#4 DELL LATITUDE 3350 13.3" Touch Laptop with 8GB
Specifications Met TBD No Bid
BASE PRICE $ 712.00 No Bid
Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 25+base bid No Bid
Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty 49 + base bid No Bid
Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 89+ base bid No Bid
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 35 + base bid No Bid
Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty 69 + base bid No Bid
Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 109+base bid No Bid
#5 DELL LATITUDE 5289 12" 2-in-1 LAPTOP with 8GB
Specifications Met TBD Yes
BASE PRICE $ 1,125.00 | see below
Option 1 - 3 Year Basic Warranty 30+ base bid | $ 864.00
Option 2 - 3 Year NBD Warranty 69+ base bid | $ 909.00
Option 3 - 3 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 99+ base bid | $ 956.00
Option 4 - 4 Year Basic Warranty 40+ base bid | $ 896.00
Option 5 - 4 Year NBD Warranty 89+ base bid | $ 964.00
Option 6 - 4 Year NBD Warranty with Accidental Damage Protection 119+ base bid | $  1,038.00
#6 USB Docking Station - Dell D3100 (Dell Part #452-BBPG) or Equal
BASE PRICE | $ 118.50 | $ 105.00 |

AWARD TO CDW




