COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result
BID NO: RFQ 17/79
SUBJECT: DHS Misc. Furniture
DATE: 4/21/2017
SCHOOL/DEPT: Douglass HS
AWARDED TO: Highlighted below in GREEN
Vendors Section A | Section B Section C Section D
\T/ci)rrf;’nce, cA $30,377.33 | $20,485.40 $26,739.23 No Bid
J'\g:cfesr‘;‘;;' C\fg,ca,\;g nal Enterprises $33,844.00 $19,686.00 No Bid
ggﬁt%:soﬂassmom $27,515.11 No Bid No Bid
S;?tbv?,gfﬂﬁé%ﬂem $36,661.40 | $27,268.62 $24,327.12 No Bid
('\:Ao?ﬁtg};”Mo $47,506.65 | $32,105.63 | 17996.11/23825.74 | $15,775.92
'G?rggfst $24,362.70 $14,761.31 No Bid
ﬁ]%r:pngfg;i'eyc%cepts & Furn. $40,129.35 | $27,681.16 $18,275.51 $14,393.25
gﬁ{%ﬁ:ﬁf&%‘ﬁa's $26,199.15 $19,303.56 -
agr‘]gf?;lipgﬁia'ty No Bid No Bid No Bid
(S:icnrgﬁ]%'aﬁuégtters $29,427.00 $24,633.00 -
E;ﬂ?;g%ity’ MO $23,640.74 $17,730.87 $13,295.91
(':glsljr?]ii;mgnes $47,469.40 | $33,343.54 $24,220.16 $13,044.49
gﬁgﬂmﬁg ?,gice* $31,164.25 | $25,019.00 $24,633.00 -

*math error on section B
RED not accepted as equal



