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AWARDED TO:
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Unit

Conn 20K 
Lacquer 

Sousaphone (Qty 
3)

Yamaha 204M 
Marching Mellophone 

Unit

Yamaha 204M 
Marching Mellophone 

(Qty 5)
Yamaha YBH-301M 

Baritone Unit
Yamaha YBH-301M 

Baritone (Qty 4) YAMAHA TOTAL

Shar Lamberti Tertis 
15.5” Viola Outfit 

(Qty 1)
3 5 4

3 5 4
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3 5 4
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3 5 4
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MELHART MUSIC CENTER - McAllen, Tx 6230 $18,690.00 $1,217.00 $6,085.00 $1,677.00 $6,708.00 $12,793.00 NO BID

PALEN MUSIC - Columbia, MO 6557.47 $19,672.41 $1,281.05 $6,405.25 $1,765.26 $7,061.04 $13,466.29 NO BID

$7,424.00 $14,174.00 NO BID

DILLON MUSIC - Woodbridge, NJ 6922 $20,766.00 $1,352.00 $6,760.00 $1,863.00 $7,452.00 $14,212.00 NO BID
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Fine Arts

5762

0

6295

$1,175.00

$1,211.00

$1,250.00

$1,615.00

$1,659.00

$1,725.00

NO BID $6,055.00 $6,636.00 NO BID

Highlighted Below in Green

Vendors

$17,286.00 $5,875.00 $6,460.00 NO BID

$19,131.00 $6,585.00 $7,108.00 NO BID

$18,885.00 $6,250.00 $6,900.00 NO BID

$1,317.00 $1,777.00

$6,431.60 $369.90

$19,617.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

$22,155.00 $0.00 $0.00 NO BID

$1,290.00

$1,168.90

$1,770.00

$1,607.90

WOODWIND AND BRASSWIND INC - Westlake 
Village, CA $19,710.00 $6,450.00 $7,080.00 $13,530.00 NO BID

NO BID

MIDWEST MUSICAL IMPORTS - Minneapolis, MN

NORTHEAST MUSIC INC - Latham, NY

BAND INSTRUMENT SERVICE - St. Charles, MO

SHIVELBINES MUSIC STORE - Cape Girardeau, MO

ACCENT MUSIC INC - Wilmington, DE

HICKEYS MUSIC CENTER - Ithaca, NY

CASCIO INTERSTATE MUSIC - New Berlin, WI

$12,335.00

$12,691.00

$13,150.00

$13,693.00

NO BID

NO BID

$12,276.10

$18,126.00

$17,348.70 $5,844.50

NO BID

MUSIC & ARTS CENTER - Dallas, Tx $17,376.00 $5,790.00 $6,388.00 $12,178.00 NO BID

UNIVERSAL MELODY - Dallas, Tx

MOZINGO MUSIC - Ellisville, MO $18,495.00 $6,315.00 $6,932.00 $13,247.00

$0.00 $0.00 NO BID

$1,263.00

$1,158.00

$1,733.00

$1,597.00

NICK RAIL MUSIC Santa Barbara, CA $18,435.00 $6,185.00 $6,820.00 $13,005.00 $1,750.00

WASHINGTON MUSIC CENTER - Wheaton, MD $17,280.00 $5,795.00 $6,388.00 $12,183.00 NO BID5760

6145

$1,159.00

$1,237.00

$1,597.00

$1,705.00

MUSICIANS FRIEND - Indianapolis, IN 6972 $20,916.00 $1,350.00 $6,750.00 $1,856.00

SHAR PRODUCTS COMPANY - Ann Arbor, MI NO BID $2,248.00NO BID


