
BID NO:

SUBJECT:

DATE:

SCHOOL/DEPT:

AWARDED TO:

Manufacturer Model Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Model Unit Price Total Price Manufacturer Model Unit Price Total Price

COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT
Bid Result

RFQ 17/72

Custodial Equipment

3/14/2017

Custodial  

$0.00$0.00

See below highlighted in Green

Vendors

Minuteman Max Rider 26"
NSS 27" Riding eForce 

Battery Burnisher
Tom Cat Edge 28" HD Oscillating Electric Floor Machine NSS 20" Charger 2022DB Battery Burnisher

Kaivac Battery-Powered 
Autovac

$9,651.12$7,365.28 IPC Eagle
Integra -D28" 

Orbital
$2,478.50 $34,699.00No BidAll-Type Vacuum & Janitorial Supply As specified $6,875.00 $13,750.00 $7,365.28

$0.00 $0.00$0.00

St. Louis, MO

Pur-O-Zone No bid

As Specified $4,825.56

No Bid

All-Type Vacuum & Janitorial Supply Bid 2 No bid

Lawrence, KS

$10,556.10

$8,539.57

No Bid As Specified EDGE-28HD110 $3,129.88 $43,818.32

EBG-28 $2,665.00 $37,310.00 NSS Charger 2022BB $5,695.00 $11,390.00Industrial Soap Company No bid $8,539.57 Square Scrub*

Earth City, MO $1,995.00 $3,990.00

St. Louis, MO No Bid

$0.00

New System

$0.00 $0.00$0.00 $0.00

No bid

No Bid Tennant 
Nobles, Speed 

Gleam 5
$4,220.00 $8,440.00St. Louis, MO No Bid No Bid

No BidNo Bid $2,550.00 $5,100.00

TomCat 200 UHS 20' Battery 
Burnisher, 200-TB $5,278.05


