COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result

BID NO:	RFP 17/71		
SUBJECT:	Musical Instruments		
DATE:	3/10/2017		
SCHOOL/DEPT:	Fine Arts		
AWARDED TO:	Highlighted in Green Below		

Vendors	Total Remo	Total Studio 49	Total Sonor
Washington Music Center Wheaton, MD	\$8,262.80	\$29,101.90	\$4,617.90
West Music Coralville, IA	\$7,602.98	\$30,245.00	\$4,047.00
Woodwind & Brasswind, Inc Westlake Village, CA	\$7,406.00	\$31,960.00	\$4,320.00
Universal Melody Services Dallas, TX	No bid	\$30,127.26	No Bid
Nick Rail Music Santa Barbara, CA	\$7,630.00	\$30,415.00	\$4,530.00
Music & Arts Center Dallas, TX	\$7,784.00	\$33,644.00	\$6,600.00
Mozingo Music Ellisville, MO	\$7,966.00	\$29,160.00	\$4,395.00
Sweetwater Music Education Technology Fort Wayne, IN	\$8,866.34	No Bid	No Bid