COLUMBIA PUBLIC SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid Result
BID NO: RFQ 17/09
SUBJECT: Projectors and Projection Boards
DATE: 4/26/2016
SCHOOL/DEPT: Beulah Ralph Elementary
AWARDED TO: Schillers & VSA
vendors Projectors Projection Boards

Unit Cost | Total Cost | Qty 1-5 | Qty 6-10 | Unit Cost | Total Cost | Qty 1-5| Qty 6-10 TOTAL
Schillers AV
St Louis. MO $1,511.00 | $67,995.00 | $1,556.00 | $1,511.00 | $515.00 | $23,175.00 | $596.00 | $515.00 $91.170.00
Kansas City Audio Visual
Kansas City. MO $1,528.85 | $68,798.25 | $1,543.85 | $1,529.00 | $498.89 | $22,450.05 | $589.00 | $519.00 $91,248.30
Sgﬁ\é'nGHms L $1,525.00 | $68,625.00 | $1,525.00 | $1,525.00 | $505.00 | $22,725.00 | $505.00 | $505.00 $91.350.00
feisegelfgntat'on Systems $1,560.00 | $70,200.00 | $1,560.00 | $1,560.00 | $509.00 | $22,905.00 | $509.00 | $509.00 $93.105.00
g?e';rf:,riﬁ;eiﬂona' Computers, Inc. $1,935.00 | $87,075.00 | $1,935.00 | $1,935.00 | $540.00 | $24,300.00 | $540.00 | $540.00 $111,375.00
['a?]‘;‘é?r&gecmo'ogySO'“t'O”S $2,007.00 | $90,315.00 | $2,007.00 | $2,007.00 | $527.00 | $23,715.00 | $527.00 | $527.00 $114,030.00
ﬁf‘WHYF;TEtﬁQ/'deO $2,078.00 | $93,510.00 | $2,178.00 | $2,178.00 | $510.00 | $22,950.00 | $699.00 | $699.00 $116,460.00
VSA, Inc. ) . ) .
Lincoln, NE No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $498.60 | $22,437.00 | $574.00 | $560.00 N/A




